HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
LN A W D= O O NN NN R, WNDY = O

158
134, section 149 of Public Law 100-17, and sections
1006, 1069, 1103, 1104, 1105, 1106, 1107, 1108, 6005,
6015, and 6023 of Public Liaw 102-240 are permanently
rescinded. In addition, the unobligated balance available
on September 30, 2011, under section 1602 of the Trans-
portation Equity Act for the 21st Century (Public Law
105-178) for each project for which less than 10 percent
of the amount authorized for such project under such sec-
tion has been obligated is permanently rescinded. In addi-
tion, of the amounts authorized for fiscal years 2005
through 2009 in section 1101(a)(16) of the Safe, Account-
able, Flexible, Efficient Transportation Equity Act: A
Legacy for Users (Public Law 109-59) to carry out the
high priority projects program under section 117 of title
23, United States Code, that are not allocated for projects
described in section 1702 of such Act, $8,190,335 are per-

manently rescinded.

DIVISION B—SURFACE
TRANSPORTATION EXTENSION

SEC. 4001. SHORT TITLE; RECONCILIATION OF FUNDS.
(a) SHORT TI1TLE.—This division may be cited as the
“Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2010, Part 117,

(b) RECONCILIATION OF FUNDS.—The Secretary of

Transportation shall reduce the amount apportioned or al-

located for a program, project, or activity under this divi-

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N Bk W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS R S e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN B, WD = O

159
sion 1n fiscal year 2011 by amounts apportioned or allo-
cated pursuant to the Surface Transportation Extension
Act of 2010 for the period beginning on October 1, 2010,

and ending on December 31, 2010.

TITLE I—-FEDERAL-AID
HIGHWAYS

SEC. 4101. EXTENSION OF FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAY PRO-
GRAMS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 411 of the Surface Trans-
portation Extension Act of 2010 (Public Law 111-147,;
124 Stat. 78) 1s amended—

(1) by striking “the period beginning on Octo-

ber 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 20107

each place it appears (except in subsection (c)(2))

and inserting “fiscal year 20117,

(2) in subsection (a) by striking “December 31,

20107 and inserting ‘“‘September 30, 20117,

(3) in subsection (b)(2) by striking ‘14 of”’;
(4) 1n subsection (¢)—
(A) in paragraph (2)—
(1) by striking “V4 of”’; and
(i1) by striking “‘the period beginning
on October 1, 2010, and ending on Decem-
ber 31, 2010,” and inserting ‘“‘fiscal year
20117

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN O TN N T NG I NS T NS R e e T e e T e T e T Y =
[ B N U N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) B ~SU O B NO S e

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

160

(B) in paragraph (4)—

(1) in subparagraph (A)(ii) by striking
“, except that during such period obliga-
tions subject to such limitation shall not
exceed V4 of the limitation on obligations
included in an Act making appropriations
for fiseal year 20117; and

(i1) in subparagraph (B)@i)(II) by
striking  “$159,750,000” and inserting
“$639,000,000’; and

(C) by striking paragraph (5);

(5) in subsection (d)—

(A) by striking “V4 of”” each place it ap-

pears; and

(B) in paragraph (2)(A)—

(1) in the matter preceding clause (1)
by striking “apportioned under sections
104(b) and 144 of title 23, United States
Code,” and inserting ‘“‘specified in section
105(a)(2) of title 23, United States Code
(except the high priority projects pro-
eram),”’; and

(i) in clause (ii) by striking “‘appor-
tioned under such sections of such Code”

and inserting ‘“‘specified in such section



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N BB W =

|\ 2N \© R O R \O N O B e e e e e T e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

161
105(a)(2) (except the high priority projects
program)”’; and
(6) in subsection (e)(1)(B) by striking ““1/4”.

(b) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section 412(a)(2)

of the Surface Transportation Extension Act of 2010

(Public Law 111-147; 124 Stat. 83) is amended—

(1) by striking “$105,606,250” and inserting
“$422,425,000; and

(2) by striking “the period beginning on Octo-
ber 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 20107
and inserting ‘“‘fiscal year 2011".

TITLE II—NATIONAL HIGHWAY
TRAFFIC SAFETY ADMINIS-
TRATION, FEDERAL MOTOR
CARRIER SAFETY ADMINIS-
TRATION, AND ADDITIONAL
PROGRAMS

SEC. 4201. EXTENSION OF NATIONAL HIGHWAY TRAFFIC
SAFETY ADMINISTRATION HIGHWAY SAFETY

PROGRAMS.
(a) CHAPTER 4 HIGHWAY SAFETY PROGRAMS.—Sec-
tion 2001(a)(1) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1519) is
amended by striking “and $58,750,000 for the period be-

einning on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31,

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N B W

O TN NG TN N TR NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N O N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O TR NO S e

162
2010.” and inserting “and $235,000,000 for fiscal year
2011.7.

(b) HIGHWAY SAFETY RESEARCH AND DEVELOP-
MENT.—Section 2001(a)(2) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat.
1519) is amended by striking “and $27,061,000 for the
period beginning on October 1, 2010, and ending on De-
cember 31, 2010.” and inserting “and $108,244,000 for
fiscal year 2011.7.

(¢) OCCUPANT PROTECTION INCENTIVE GRANTS.—
Section 2001(a)(3) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1519)
is amended by striking “and $6,250,000 for the period
beginning on October 1, 2010, and ending on December
31, 2010.” and inserting “and $25,000,000 for fiscal year
2011.7.

(d) SAFETY BELT PERFORMANCE GRANTS.—Section
2001(a)(4) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1519) is amend-
ed by striking “and $31,125,000 for the period beginning
on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.”
and inserting “and $124,500,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

() STATE TRAFFIC SAFETY INFORMATION SYSTEM
IMPROVEMENTS.—Section 2001(a)(5) of SAFETEA-LU
(119 Stat. 1519) is amended by striking “and $8,625,000
for the period beginning on October 1, 2010, and ending

on December 31, 2010.” and inserting “and $34,500,000

for fiscal year 2011.".

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e
[ B N U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO R e

163

(f)  AnconorL-IMPAIRED  DRIVING  COUNTER-
MEASURES  INCENTIVE GRANT PROGRAM.—Section
2001(a)(6) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1519) is amend-
ed by striking “and $34,750,000 for the period beginning
on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.”
and inserting “and $139,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(¢)  NATIONAL  DRIVER  REGISTER.—Section
2001(a)(7) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1520) is amend-
ed by striking “and $1,029,000 for the period beginning
on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.”
and inserting “‘and $4,116,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(h) Hica VISIBILITY ENFORCEMENT PROGRAM.—
Section 2001(a)(8) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1520)
is amended by striking “and $7,250,000 for the period
beginning on October 1, 2010, and ending on December
31, 2010.” and inserting “and $29,000,000 for fiscal year
2011.7.

(1) MOTORCYCLIST SAFETY.—Section 2001(a)(9) of
SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1520) is amended by striking
“and $1,750,000 for the period beginning on October 1,
2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.” and inserting
“and $7,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(j) CHILD SAFETY AND CHILD BOOSTER SEAT SAFE-

TY INCENTIVE  GRANTS.—Section 2001(a)(10) of

SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1520) is amended by striking

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W BB W =

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

24
25

164
“and $1,750,000 for the period beginning on October 1,
2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.” and inserting
“and $7,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(k) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section
2001(a)(11) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1520) is
amended by striking “and $6,332,000 for the period be-
einning on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31,
2010.” and inserting “and $25,328,000 for fiscal year
2011.7.

SEC. 4202. EXTENSION OF FEDERAL MOTOR CARRIER SAFE-
TY ADMINISTRATION PROGRAMS.

(a) MOTOR CARRIER SAFETY GRANTS.—Section

31104(a)(7) of title 49, United States Code, is amended
by striking “$52,679,000 for the period beginning on Oc-
tober 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.” and
inserting “$209,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(b) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section

3110431)(1)(G) of title 49, United States Code, is amend-

ed by striking “$61,036,000 for the period beginning on

October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 2010.” and
inserting “‘$244,144,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(¢)  GRANT PROGRAMS.—Section  4101(¢)  of
SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1715) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—
(A) by striking “‘and” after “2009,”; and

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

[\© TN O T N T NG I NG R NS B S e e T e e T e T e T e T
b A W D= O O NN NN R, WNDY = O

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml

December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

165
(B) by striking “and $6,301,000 for the
period beginning on October 1, 2010, and end-
ing on December 31, 2010”7 and inserting ‘“‘and

$25,000,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(2) in paragraph (2) by striking “and
$8,066,000 for the period beginning on October 1,
2010, and ending on December 31, 2010” and in-
serting “and $32,000,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(3) in paragraph (3) by striking “and
$1,260,000 for the period beginning on October 1,
2010, and ending on December 31, 2010”7 and in-
serting “and $5,000,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(4) in paragraph (4) by striking ‘“and
$6,301,000 for the period beginning on October 1,
2010, and ending on December 31, 2010”7 and in-
serting “and $25,000,000 for fiscal year 20117; and

(5) in paragraph (5) by striking “and $756,000
for the period beginning on October 1, 2010, and
ending on December 31, 2010”7 and inserting “and
$3,000,000 for fiscal year 20117,

(d) HIGH-PRIORITY ACTIVITIES.—Section

31104(k)(2) of title 49, United States Code, is amended
by striking “and $3,781,000 for the period beginning on
October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31, 2010 and
inserting “and $15,000,000 for fiscal year 2011,



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W B WO

O TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS B N e T e e T e T e T T
[ N N O N N e = N e R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

166

(e) NEW ENTRANT AUDITS.—Section
31144(2)(5)(B) of title 49, United States Code, is amend-
ed by striking “(and up to $7,310,000 for the period be-
einning on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 31,
2010)".

(f) COMMERCIAL DRIVER’'S LICENSE INFORMATION
SYSTEM  MODERNIZATION.—Section  4123(d)(6)  of
SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1736) is amended by striking
“$2,016,000 for the period beginning on October 1, 2010,
and ending on December 31, 2010.” and inserting
“$8,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(2) OUTREACH AND EDUCATION.—Section 4127(e)
of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1741) is amended by strik-
ing “and 2010”7 and all that follows before “to carry out”
and inserting “2010, and 20117,

(h) GRANT PROGRAM FOR COMMERCIAL MOTOR VE-
Section 4134(¢) of SAFETEA-LU
(119 Stat. 1744) is amended by striking 2009, 2010, and

HICLE OPERATORS.

$252,000 for the period beginning on October 1, 2010,
and ending on December 31, 2010, and inserting
“20117.

(1) MorTOrR CARRIER SAFETY ADVISORY COM-
MITTEE.—Section 4144(d) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat.
1748) is amended by striking “December 31, 2010”" and

inserting ‘“‘September 30, 2011,

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N BB W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG N N0 R e T e e T e T e Y Y
[ N N O N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

167

(j) WORKING GROUP FOR DEVELOPMENT OF PRAC-
TICES AND PROCEDURES TO ENHANCE FEDERAL-STATE

RELATIONS.—Section 4213(d) of SAFETEA-LU (49

U.S.C. 14710 note; 119 Stat. 1759) is amended by strik-
ing “December 31, 2010”7 and inserting ‘“‘September 30,
20117,

SEC. 4203. ADDITIONAL PROGRAMS.

(a) HAZARDOUS MATERIALS RESEARCH
ProJECTS.—Section 7131(¢) of SAFETEA-LU (119
Stat. 1910) is amended by striking “through 2010” and
all that follows before ‘““shall be available” and inserting
“through 2011".

(b) DINGELL-JOONSON SPORT FISH RESTORATION
Acr.—Section 4 of the Dingell-Johnson Sport Fish Res-
toration Act (16 U.S.C. 777¢) 1s amended—

(1) in subsection (a) by striking “For each of
fiscal years 2006”7 and all that follows before para-
eraph (1) and inserting the following: “For each of
fiscal years 2006 through 2011, the balance of each
annual appropriation made in accordance with the
provisions of section 3 remaining after the distribu-
tions for administrative expenses and other purposes
under subsection (b) and for multistate conservation
orants under section 14 shall be distributed as fol-

lows:”’; and

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W BN~ WD = ©

168
(2) i subsection (b)(1)(A) by striking the first
sentence and inserting the following: “From the an-
nual appropriation made in accordance with section

3, for each of fiscal years 2006 through 2011, the

Secretary of the Interior may use no more than the

amount specified in subparagraph (B) for the fiscal

yvear for expenses for administration incurred in the
implementation of this Act, in accordance with this

section and section 9.7,

(¢) SURFACE TRANSPORTATION PROJECT DELIVERY
PiLor PROGRAM.—Section 327(1)(1) of title 23, United
States Code, is amended by striking “6 years after” and
inserting ‘7 years after’.

(d) IMPLEMENTATION OF FUTURE STRATEGIC HIGH-
WAY RESEARCH PROGRAM.—Section 510 of title 23,
United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the
following:

“(h) IMPLEMENTATION.—Notwithstanding any other
provision of this section, the Secretary may use funds
made available to carry out this section for implementa-
tion of research products related to the future strategic
highway research program, including development, dem-
onstration, evaluation, and technology transfer activi-

ties.”’.

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

169

1 TITLE III—PUBLIC

2 TRANSPORTATION PROGRAMS
3 SEC. 4301. ALLOCATION OF FUNDS FOR PLANNING PRO-
4 GRAMS.

5 Section 5305(g) of title 49, United States Code, is
6 amended by striking “2010, and for the period beginning
7 October 1, 2010, and ending December 31, 2010,” and
8 inserting “2011".

O SEC. 4302. SPECIAL RULE FOR URBANIZED AREA FORMULA
10 GRANTS.

11 Section 5307(b)(2) of title 49, United States Code,
12 is amended—

13 (1) in the paragraph heading by striking ‘2010,
14 AND THE PERIOD BEGINNING OCTOBER 1, 2010, AND
15 ENDING DECEMBER 31, 2010”7 and inserting “2011"’;
16 (2) in subparagraph (A) by striking “2010, and
17 the period beginning October 1, 2010, and ending
18 December 31, 2010,” and inserting “2011,”; and

19 (3) in subparagraph (E)—
20 (A) in the subparagraph heading by strik-
21 ing ‘2010 AND DURING THE PERIOD BEGINNING
22 OCTOBER 1, 2010, AND ENDING DECEMBER 31,
23 2010”" and inserting “2011”’; and
24 (B) in the matter preceding clause (i) by
25 striking “In fiscal years 2008 through 2010,

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N D B W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e D e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00O N O W B~ WD = ©

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

170
and during the period beginning October 1,
2010, and ending December 31, 2010,” and in-
serting “In each of fiscal years 2008 through

20117,

SEC. 4303. ALLOCATING AMOUNTS FOR CAPITAL INVEST-

MENT GRANTS.

Section 5309(m) of title 49, United States Code, is

amended—

(1) in paragraph (2)—

(A) in the paragraph heading by striking
“2010 AND OCTOBER 1, 2010, THROUGH DECEM-
BER 31, 2010” and inserting “20117’;

(B) in the matter preceding subparagraph
(A) by striking “2010, and during the period
beginning October 1, 2010, and ending Decem-
ber 31, 2010,” and inserting “2011”"; and

(C) in subparagraph (A)(i) by striking
“2010, and $50,000,000 for the period begin-
ning October 1, 2010, and ending December
31, 2010,” and inserting “2011";

(2) in paragraph (6)—

(A) in subparagraph (B) by striking

“2010, and $3,750,000 shall be available for

the period beginning October 1, 2010, and end-



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I NS B N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

171
ing December 31, 2010,” and inserting “2011";

and

(B) in subparagraph (C) by striking
“2010, and $1,250,000 shall be available for
the period beginning October 1, 2010 and end-
ing December 31, 2010,” and inserting “20117’;
and
(3) in paragraph (7)—

(A) in subparagraph (A)—

(1) by striking “(A) FERRY BOAT SYS-

TEMS.— and all that follows through “(i)

FISCAL  YEAR 2006 THROUGH 2010.—

$10,000,000 shall be available in each of

fiscal years 2006 through 2010”7 and in-
serting the following:

“(A) FERRY BOAT SYSTEMS.—
$10,000,000 shall be available in each of fiscal
years 2006 through 20117,

(11) by striking clause (ii);
(i) by redesignating subclauses (I)

through (VIII) as clauses (i) through (viii),

respectively, and moving the text of such

clauses 2 ems to the left; and
(iv) by inserting a period at the end

of clause (1v) (as so redesignated);



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

e T = O =
W NN = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

172

(B) by striking subparagraph (B)(vi) and
inserting the following:

“(vi) $13,500,000 for fiscal year

2011.7;

(C) in subparagraph (C) by striking *, and
during the period beginning October 1, 2010,
and ending December 31, 2010,”;

(D) in subparagraph (D) by striking *,
and not less than $8,750,000 shall be available
for the period beginning October 1, 2010, and
ending December 31, 2010,”; and

[

(E) in subparagraph (E) by striking *, and
$750,000 shall be available for the period be-
oinning October 1, 2010, and ending December
31, 2010,”.

SEC. 4304. APPORTIONMENT OF FORMULA GRANTS FOR

OTHER THAN URBANIZED AREAS.
Section 5311(¢)(1)(F) of title 49, United States

Code, is amended to read as follows:

“(I) $15,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.7.

SEC. 4305. APPORTIONMENT BASED ON FIXED GUIDEWAY

FACTORS.

Section 5337 of title 49, United States Code, is

amended—

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 9 N U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

173

(1) in subsection (a), in the matter preceding

paragraph (1), by striking “2010”7 and inserting
“20117; and

(2) by striking subsection (g).

SEC. 4306. AUTHORIZATIONS FOR PUBLIC TRANSPOR-

TATION.

(a) FORMULA AND BUS GRANTS.—Section 5338(b)

of title 49, United States Code, is amended—

(1) by striking paragraph (1)(F) and inserting

the following:

“()  $8,360,565,000 for fiscal year
2011.7; and
(2) In paragraph (2)—

(A) in subparagraph (A) by striking
“$28,375,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010, and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$113,500,000 for fiscal year 20117,

(B) in subparagraph (B) by striking
“$1,040,091,250 for the period beginning Octo-
ber 1, 2010, and ending December 31, 2010,”
and inserting “$4,160,365,000 for fiscal year
20117,

(C) in subparagraph (C) by striking
“$12,875,000 for the period beginning October



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

174
1, 2010, and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$51,500,000 for fiscal year 2011”’;

(D) in subparagraph (D) by striking
“$416,625,000 for the period beginning Octo-
ber 1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,”
and inserting “$1,666,500,000 for fiscal year
20117,

(E) in subparagraph (K) by striking
“$246,000,000 for the period beginning Octo-
ber 1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,”
and inserting “$984,000,000 for fiscal year
20117,

(F) in subparagraph () by striking
“$33,375,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$133,500,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(G) in subparagraph (G) by striking
“$116,250,000 for the period beginning Octo-
ber 1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,”
and inserting “$465,000,000 for fiscal year
20117,

(H) in subparagraph () by striking
“$41,125,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$164,500,000 for fiscal year 20117;



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

175

(I) in  subparagraph (I) by striking
“$23,125,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$92,500,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(J) in subparagraph (J) by striking
“$6,725,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$26,900,000 for fiscal year 20117’;

(K) in subparagraph (K) by striking
“$875,000 for the period beginning October 1,
2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and in-
serting “$3,500,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(L) in subparagraph (1.) by striking
“$6,250,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$25,000,000 for fiscal year 20117;

(M) in subparagraph (M) by striking
“$116,250,000 for the period beginning Octo-
ber 1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,”
and inserting “$465,000,000 for fiscal year
20117; and

(N) 1in subparagraph (N) by striking
“$2,200,000 for the period beginning October
1, 2010 and ending December 31, 2010,” and
inserting “$8,800,000 for fiscal year 20117,



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N D B W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VWV 0 N o R WD = O

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

176

CAPITAL  INVESTMENT  GRANTS.—Section

5338(¢)(6) of title 49, United States Code, is amended

to read as follows:

“(6) $2,000,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”

(¢) RESEARCH AND UNIVERSITY RESEARCH CEN-
TERS.—Section 5338(d) of title 49, United States Code,

1s amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph
(A) by striking “$17,437,500 for the period be-
oinning October 1, 2010, and ending December
31, 2010 and inserting “$69,750,000 for fiscal
vear 2011”; and

(B) in subparagraph (A) by striking “fiscal
year 2009”7 and inserting “cach of fiscal years
2009, 2010, and 20117,
(2) in paragraph (2)(A)—

(A) in clauses (i), (i1), and (i) by striking
“2009” and inserting “2011”; and

(B) in clauses (v), (vi), (vii), and (viii) by
striking “‘and 2009”7 and inserting ‘“‘through
20117; and

(3) by striking paragraph (3) and inserting the

following:



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\ I NS R T e e e T e T e D e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22
23

177

“(3) FunNDING.—If the Secretary determines

that a project or activity deseribed in paragraph (2)

received sufficient funds in fiscal year 2010, or a

previous fiscal year, to carry out the purpose for

which the project or activity was authorized, the

Secretary may not allocate any amounts under para-

oraph (2) for the project or activity for fiscal year

2011, or any subsequent fiscal year.”.

(d) ADMINISTRATION.—Section 5338(e)(6) of title
49, United States Code, is amended to read as follows:

“(6) $98,911,000 for fiscal year 2011.”,
SEC. 4307. AMENDMENTS TO SAFETEA-LU.

(a) CONTRACTED PARATRANSIT PIrLoT.—Section
3009(1)(1) of SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1572) is amend-
ed by striking “2010, and for the period beginning Octo-
ber 1, 2010, and ending December 31, 2010”" and insert-
ing “2011".

(b) PUBLIC-PRIVATE PARTNERSHIP PIiLotr PRro-
GRAM.—Section 3011 of SAFETEA-LU (49 U.S.C. 5309
note; 119 Stat. 1588) is amended—

(1) in subsection (¢)(5) by striking “2010 and
the period beginning October 1, 2010, and ending

December 31, 2010 and inserting “2011”"; and

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

178

(2) in subsection (d) by striking “2010, and for
the period beginning October 1, 2010, and ending
December 31, 2010”7 and inserting 20117,

(¢) ELDERLY INDIVIDUALS AND INDIVIDUALS WITIH
DISABILITIES PILoT PROGRAM.—Section 3012(b)(8) of
SAFETEA-LU (49 U.S.C. 5310 note; 119 Stat. 1593)
is amended by striking ‘“December 31, 2010 and insert-
ing “September 30, 20117,

(d) OBLIGATION CEILING.—Section 3040(7) of
SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1639) is amended to read as
follows:

“(7) $10,507,752,000 for fiscal year 2011, of
which not more than $8,360,565,000 shall be from
the Mass Transit Account.”.

(e) PROJECT AUTHORIZATIONS FOR NEW FIXED
Section 3043  of

GUIDEWAY CAPITAL PROJECTS.

SAFETEA-LU (119 Stat. 1640) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b), in the matter preceding
paragraph (1), by striking “2010, and for the period
beginning October 1, 2010, and ending December
31, 2010,” and inserting “2011”"; and

(2) in subsection (¢), in the matter preceding
paragraph (1), by striking “2010, and for the period
beginning October 1, 2010, and ending December

31, 2010,” and inserting “2011".

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



H:\REBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML
179
1 (f) ALLOCATIONS FOR NATIONAL RESEARCH AND

TECHINOLOGY PROGRAMS.—Section 3046 of SAFETEA-

LU (49 U.S.C. 5338 note; 119 Stat. 1706) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b) by striking “or period’;

2
3
4
5 (2) by striking subsection (¢) and inserting the
6 following:

7 “(e) ADDITIONAL APPROPRIATIONS.—The Secretary
8 shall allocate amounts appropriated pursuant to section
9 5338(d) of title 49, United States Code, for national re-
10 search and technology programs under sections 5312,
11 5314, and 5322 of such title for fiscal years 2010 and
12 2011, in amounts equal to the amounts allocated for fiscal

13 year 2009 under each of paragraphs (2), (3), (5), (6), and

14 (8) through (25) of subsection (a).”’; and

15 (3) in subsection (d)—

16 (A) by striking “2009” and inserting
17 “20107; and

18 (B) by striking “20107 and inserting
19 “20117.

20 SEC. 4308. LEVEL OF OBLIGATION LIMITATIONS.

21 (a) Hicaway CATEGORY.—Section 8003(a) of
22 SAFETEA-LU (2 U.S.C. 901 note; 119 Stat. 1917) is
23 amended—

24 (1) in paragraph (6) by striking “for the period

25 beginning on October 1, 2009, and ending on Sep-

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W B W =

e T S S e e S I =
O o0 N O »n B~ W N = O

20
21
22
23
24

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

180
tember 30, 2010,” and inserting ‘“‘for fiscal year
2010,”; and
(2) by striking paragraph (7) and inserting the
following:
“(7) for fiscal year 2011, $42,469,970,178.”.

(b) MASS TRANSIT CATEGORY.—Section 8003(b) of

SAFETEA-LU (2 U.S.C. 901 note; 119 Stat. 1917) is

amended—

(1) in paragraph (6) by striking “for the period
beginning on October 1, 2009, and ending on De-
cember 31, 2010,” and inserting “for fiscal year
2010,”; and

(2) by striking paragraph (7) and inserting the
following:

“(7) for fiscal year 2011, $10,338,065,000.”.

TITLE IV—EXTENSION OF
EXPENDITURE AUTHORITY

SEC. 4401. EXTENSION OF EXPENDITURE AUTHORITY.

(a) HicrmwaAy TRusT FunND.—Section 9503 of the

Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended—

(1) by striking “December 31, 2010 (January
1, 2011, in the case of expenditures for administra-
tive expenses)”” in subsections (b)(6)(B) and (¢)(1)

and inserting “October 1, 20117,



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

181

1 (2) by striking “the Surface Transportation Ex-
2 tension Act of 2010”7 in subsections (¢)(1) and
3 (e)(3) and inserting ‘“‘the Surface Transportation
4 Extension Act of 2010, Part 11", and

5 (3) by striking “January 1, 2011” in subsection
6 (e)(3) and inserting “October 1, 20117,

7 (b) SPORT KISt RESTORATION AND BOATING TRUST
8 FuND.—Section 9504 of the Internal Revenue Code of
9 1986 is amended—
10 (1) by striking “Surface Transportation Exten-
11 sion Act of 2010”7 each place it appears in sub-
12 section (b)(2) and inserting ‘“‘Surface Transportation
13 Extension Act of 2010, Part 11", and
14 (2) by striking “January 1, 2011” in subsection
15 (d)(2) and inserting “October 1, 20117,
16 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

17 this section shall take effect on December 31, 2010.

18 DIVISION C—AIRPORT AND

19 AIRWAY EXTENSION

20 SEC. 5001. SHORT TITLE.

21 This division may be cited as the “Airport and Air-

22 way Extension Act of 2010, Part IV”.

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 9 O D kA WD =

[ S e e T T T =N =Y
AN »n A W NN = O

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)

182

SEC. 5002. EXTENSION OF TAXES FUNDING AIRPORT AND

AIRWAY TRUST FUND.

(a) FueL Taxes.—Subparagraph (B) of section

4081(d)(2) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended by striking “December 31, 2010 and inserting

“September 30, 20117,

(b) TICKET TAXES.

(1)  PERSONS.—Clause (1) of  section
4261(3)(1)(A) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986
is amended by striking “December 31, 2010”7 and
inserting “September 30, 20117,

(2)  PrROPERTY.—Clause (i1) of section
4271(d)(1)(A) of such Code is amended by striking
“December 31, 2010”7 and inserting ““September 30,

20117,

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall take effect on January 1, 2011.

SEC. 5003. EXTENSION OF AIRPORT AND AIRWAY TRUST

FUND EXPENDITURE AUTHORITY.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section 9502(d)

of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended—

(1) by striking “January 1, 2011” and insert-
ing “October 1, 201177; and

[

(2) by inserting “or the Airport and Airway Ex-
tension Act of 2010, Part IV” before the semicolon

at the end of subparagraph (A).



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W BB W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N R, W N = O

183

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Paragraph (2) of
section 9502 (e) of such Code is amended by striking “Jan-
uary 1, 2011”7 and inserting “October 1, 20117,

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall take effect on January 1, 2011.
SEC. 5004. EXTENSION OF AIRPORT IMPROVEMENT PRO-

GRAM.

(a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section

48103(8) of title 49, United States Code, is amended to
read as follows:
“(8) $3,700,000,000 for fiscal year 2011.”.

(b) PROJECT GRANT AUTHORITY.—Section 47104 (¢)
of such title is amended by striking “December 31, 2010,”
and inserting ‘“‘September 30, 2011,”.

SEC. 5005. EXTENSION OF EXPIRING AUTHORITIES.

(a) Section 40117(1)(7) of title 49, United States
Code, is amended by striking “January 1, 2011.” and in-
serting “‘October 1, 2011.7.

(b) Section 44302(f)(1) of such title is amended—

(1) by striking “December 31, 2010,” and in-
serting “September 30, 2011,”; and

(2) by striking “March 31, 2011,” and insert-
ing “December 31, 2011,”.

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

O o0 N N W Bk W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = ©

184
(¢) Section 44303(b) of such title is amended by

striking “March 31, 2011,” and inserting ‘“‘December 31,
2011,”.

(d) Section 47107(s)(3) of such title is amended by
striking “January 1, 2011.” and inserting “October 1,
2011.7.

(e) Section 47115(j) of such title is amended by strik-
ing “fiscal years 2004 through 2010, and for the portion
of fiseal year 2011 ending before January 1, 2011, and
inserting “‘fiscal years 2004 through 2011,”.

(f) Section 47141(f) of such title is amended by strik-
ing “December 31, 2010.” and inserting ‘““‘September 30,
2011.7.

() Section 49108 of such title is amended by striking
“December 31, 2010,” and inserting ‘“September 30,
2011,”.

(h) Section 161 of the Vision 100—Century of Avia-
tion Reauthorization Act (49 U.S.C. 47109 note) 1is
amended by striking “fiscal year 2009 or 2010, or in the
portion of fiscal year 2011 ending before January 1,
2011,” and inserting “fiscal year 2009, 2010, or 20117,

(1) Section 186(d) of such Act (117 Stat. 2518) is
amended by striking ‘“‘for fiscal years ending before Octo-

ber 1, 2010, and for the portion of fiscal year 2011 ending

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)



HAREBECCA\FY11 CR\FULL YEAR\FULL YEAR CR (FINAL).XML

S O 0 N N B WD

— e e e e e e e
<N O R WD =

185
before January 1, 2011,” and inserting “for fiscal years
ending before October 1, 2011,”.
(j) The amendments made by this section shall take
effect on January 1, 2011.

DIVISION D—FOOD SAFETY

SEC. 6001. SHORT TITLE; REFERENCES; TABLE OF CON-
TENTS.

(a) SHORT TI1TLE.—This division may be cited as the
“FDA Food Safety Modernization Act”.

(b) REFERENCES.—Except as otherwise specified,
whenever in this division an amendment is expressed in
terms of an amendment to a section or other provision,
the reference shall be considered to be made to a section

or other provision of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cos-
metic Act (21 U.S.C. 301 et seq.).
(¢) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for
this division is as follows:
DIVISION D—FOOD SAFETY
See. 6001. Short title; references; table of contents.

TITLE I—IMPROVING CAPACITY TO PREVENT FOOD SAFETY
PROBLEMS

See. 6101. Inspections of records.

See. 6102, Registration of food facilities.

See. 6103. Hazard analysis and risk-based preventive controls.
See. 6104. Performance standards.

See. 6105. Standards for produce safety.

See. 6106. Protection against intentional adulteration.
See. 6107. Authority to collect fees.

See. 6108. National agriculture and food defense strategy.
See. 6109. Food and Agriculture Coordinating Counecils.
Sec. 6110. Building domestie capacity.

See. 6111. Sanitary transportation of food.

See. 6112, Food allergy and anaphylaxis management.

L:\VA\120810\120810.003.xml
December 8, 2010 (7:52 a.m.)





